
LPDS Primary English and Literacy Team Units of Work  

 
 

The Primary English and Literacy team have developed a suite of units which can support 
schools to develop curriculum mapping/pathways for an English curriculum.  



LPDS Primary English and Literacy Team Units of Work  

 
English Units  
 
Half-termly unit plans for each year group consisting of fiction, non-fiction and poetry 
units.  
 
English Planning Units: Complete Set for Year 1 – Year 6  
              Autumn Term 
              https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=907 
              Spring Term 
              https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=941 
              Summer Term 
              https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=982 
 
These units can also be purchased as individual, half-termly units for each year group from 
this webpage: 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/?subject=ENG  
 
Bridging Units 
 
The bridging units are recommended to be used during the autumn term.  They secure key 
skills from the previous year group.  
 
English Bridging Units – All Year Groups  
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1057 
 
 
Reception into Year 1: Harry the Happy Mouse 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1051  
Year 1 into Year 2: The Way Home for Wolf 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1052 
Year 2 into Year 2: A Bear Called Paddington 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1053 
Year 3 into Year 4: The Loch Ness Monster 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1054  
Year 4 into Year 5: The Lion, The Witch and The Wardrobe 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1055  
Year 5 into Year 6: The Nowhere Emporium  
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1056  
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Mixed Age Units  
 
The mixed-age units are designed to be delivered in either of the year groups specified or a 
mixed-age class. Key Learning from both year groups is referenced throughout the 
planning.  
 
The Highway Rat Y1, Y2 or Y1/2: 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1215 
The Hundred and One Dalmatians Y3, Y4 or Y3/4: 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1214 
Goodnight Mister Tom Y5, Y6 or Y5/6: 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1227 
 
Last Push Pack Units for Year 2 and Year 6 
 
These units can be used during the summer term, ideally the end of summer 1 into 
summer 2, and provide support to generate end of year outcomes for writing in Year 2 and 
Year 6. It is recommended that selected LPDS English Units are delivered across the year, 
prior to these, in order to foreground the 'last push'.  
 
English Unit Planning for Year 2 – Aladdin  
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1090 
 
English Unit Planning for Year 6 – Wonder  
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=996 
 
English Unit Planning for Year 6 – The 1000 Year Old Boy  
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1093 
 
English Unit Planning for Year 6 – The Lion and Albert 
https://www.lancashire.gov.uk/lpds/publications/details/?id=1260 
 
 
 
 
Talk Programme Units  
 
These units are available when attending the Talk Programmes from Year 1 to Year 6 via 
deep and sustained CPD.  
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